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‘ COUNTRY PRICE / TOTAL/
OFFER POS /ARTNO ‘DESCRIPTION ITEM OF ORIGIN QTY. [UNIT ITEM (USS) ‘PRICE (US$) Z
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58 S i T e o A | ¥
REFERENCE NO.: 91204774 | AR y L e
140122024 |10 199-999-99-99 |[NOBID PLAREOO-OM ~ [DE e Gl e
140122024 20 99-999-99-99 |NOBD It PLA-RE00-012 DE 1P ! 1T
140122024 |30 09-005-23-07 |Doubleclip, Acland, wirame, A, 17 mm  |PLA-RE00-013 DE ® e | 132.26 11,638.88
140122024 |40 99-999-99-99 |NO BID PLA-RE00-014 |DE PC I T
140122024 |50 (99-999-99-99 NOBID. : _PLARE00-015 DE .. , e <
140122024 |60 |10-878-00-07 |DERMATOME, HUMBY, COMPLETE, 32 CMPLA-RE00-016 = DE 40 |PC [ 142596 ~ 57,038.40
140122024 (70 |37-546-18-07 | SEPTUM ELEVATOR, FREER, SHBL, 18 CIPLAREQ0-017  |DE 1% [PC | 3750 5,850.00
140122024 |80 |37-557-22-07 |Elevator, Howarth, 23 cm |PLA-RE00-018 DE 85 PC | 8982 | 763470
140122024 |90 |99-999-99-99 [NO BID PLARE0-021  |DE PC ] e
140122024 100 |28-203-15-07 | SKIN HOOKLET, KILNER, GRACILE, 14.5 C|PLA-RE00-022 DE 1183 e ] 4000 | 652000 |
140122024 |10 99-999-99-99 |NOBID el PLA-RE00-027 DE R B i o
140122024 120 |12-404-12-07 |DRESSING FORCEPS, MICRO-ADSON, 12|PLA-RE00-028 My 154 PC | 35.00 5,390.00
140122024 130 |99-999-99-99 |NO BID PLAREO0-030  |DE 2 PC & ilewe Sy
140122024 |140 12-410-12-07 |FORCEPS, JEWELER, STR, NO. 3, 12 CM|PLARE00-031 MY 112 |pc 6900 | 7,728.00
140122024 150 |12-412-11-07  |Forceps, jeweler, str., #3 C,@0,4mm,12cm | PLA-RE00-032 AT MY _|105 _|PC _79.00 | 829500
140122024 160 09-003-53-07 |Forceps, Adson, perfor,, 1x21, 12 cm PLA-RE00-033 |DE 165 PC | 9500 | 1567500
140122024 |170 |12-400-12-07 |FORCEPS,ADSONBROWN, 12CM  |PLA-REQ0-035 MY 123 [PC 7200 | 8,856.00
140122024 180 |12-172-12-07 |DRESSING FORCEPS, SEMKEN, 12.5 CM |PLA-RE00-037 [ 7 A [ 78.00 JT 77777 912600
140122024 190 |23-832-19-07 |BONE RONGEUR, LEMPERT, STR., 19 CM|PLA-RE00-038 DE 76 __PC 232.40 17,662.40




.

140122024 |200 [09-009-76-07 |Forceps, nasal, Tilley, 2.2 mm, 13 cm |PLA-RE00-039 A DR fe1 e 9746 | 8,868.86
140122024 [210 |13-915-08-07 |TOWEL FORCEPS, BACKHAUS, SHARP, O|PLA-RE00040 (MY 161 PC |  29.00 4669.00
140122024 [220 |13-310-14-07 |HAEM. FORCEPS, MOSQUITO, STR., 14.5 |PLA-RE00-041 MY 61 |PC 37.36 2,278.9
140122024 230 |99-999-99-99 |NO BID PLA-RE00-042 ~_|bE ___|p6 ol A
140122024 240 |30-131-15-07 |Forceps, tissue, Allis, 2x3 t., 15,5 cm PLA-RE00-043 DE 123 |Pc | 12728 | = 1565544
140122024 250 |12-172-15-07 |DRESSING FORCEPS, SEMKEN, 15 CM _|PLA-RE00-045 My 9% |PC 9800 | 9,604.00
140122024 260 |24-388-16-07 |ATR. FORCEPS, DE BAKEY, 2 MM, 16 CM_|PLA-RE00-046 DE 121 _|pC ~ 50.00 1 6,050.00
140122024 270 |12-372-15-07 | Diss. forceps, Semken, 1x2 T, 15¢m  |PLA-RE00-047 |DE_ 138 [P | 4900 |  6,762.00
140122024 280 [12-301-14-07 |TISSUE FORCEPS, 1X2 T, 14.5CM PLA-RE00-048 MY 165 |PC 4800 | 792000
140122024 |290 |13-310-12-07 |HAEM. FORCEPS, MOSQUITO, STR., 12.5|PLA-RE00-049 MY 153 |PC |  49.00
140122024 300 |12-460-23-07 |FORCEPS, FENESTRATED JAW, 23 CM  |PLA-RE00-050 ~ |oE 107 _[pc | 10600 |
140122024 [310 [20-348-15-07 |NEEDLEHOLDER, CRILE-MURRAY, SLIM, {PLA-RE00-051 MY 249 °PC 9700 |
140122024 |320 |20-646-18-07 |TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, DE BAKEY, 18 CM |PLA-RE00-052 MY 106 |PC 8000 |
140122024 330 |20-631-13-07 | TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, KILNER, BAYON., 14/PLA-RE00-053 _|DE |19 |pc ~90.00
140122024 (340 |20-637-13-07 | TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, HALSEY, 13CM _ [PLA-RE00-054 - UMY 116 _[pc 83.00 |
140122024 350 |20-632-12-07 | TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, DERF, 12 CM |PLA-RE00-055 MY 9 |PC 85.00
140122024 360 |20-620-00-07 | TC-MICRO NEEDLEH., STR., W. LOCK,14.5PLA-RE00-056 b Jsg fpci [ 38368 | 3494752
140122024 (370 |20-654-13-07 |TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, RYDER-VASCULAR, |PLA-RE00-057 My 78 [(PC | 13438 |  10480.08
140122024 |380 |20-654-15-07 |TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, RYDER-VASCULAR, |PLA-RE00-058 MY ____|e0_|PC 13436 8,061.60
140122024 |390 |20-672-14-07 |TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, OLSEN-HEGAR, 14.5PLA-RE00-059 My  le¢e [pc | 17922 |  17,205.12
140122024 400 |20-350-15-07 |NEEDLEHOLDER, CRILE-WOOD, GROOVEPLA-RE00-060 Iy 76 |PC 63.76 | 484576
140122024 |410 |20-338-13-07 |NEEDLEHOLDER, NEIVERT, GROOVED, 17PLA-RE00-061 2 _ |DE |4 |Pc 125.26 801664
140122024 |420 |20-466-14-07 |NEEDLEHOLDER, OLSEN-HEGAR, STR., 1PLA-RE00-062 ~  DE |67 |PC | 11076 7,420.92
140122024 430 |99-999-99-99 |NOBID PLAREO0-063 |DE SR |- T Ean
140122024 440 |20-637-12-07 |TC-NEEDLEHOLD., WEBSTER, SMOOTH, {PLA-REQ0-064 MY 85 |PC 98.10 8,338.50
140122024 450 |20-650-13-07 | TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, RYDER-MARTIN, 12./PLA-RE00-065 o e 60 |PC 19162 | 11,497.20
140122024 460 [20-650-15-07 |TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, RYDER-MARTIN, 15 |PLA-RE00-066 B 14798 | 10,802.54
140122024 |470 |20-654-15-07 | TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, RYDER-VASCULAR, |[PLA-RE00-067 MY 91 |PC  134.36 . 12,226.76
140122024 480 |99-999-99-99 |NO BID ; PLA-RE00-068 S IDE] E: p@e T L - =
140122024 490 [23-262-19-04  |Mallet, 185 gr., si., 19 cm PLAREO0-06 @ |DE  |107 |PC } 21096 | 2257272\
140122024 |500 |31-599-00-07 |URETHRAL BOUGIES, V. BUREN, 8-36. CH |PLA-RE00-070 DE 171 |PC 68132 | 11650572
140122024 510 |99-999-99-99 |NO BID PLA-RE00-073 SR - ] - o . 3 ﬂL eEEsin G
140122024 520 |99-999-99-99 |NO BID PLA-RE00-074 DE PC ¥
140122024 530 |11-331-18-07 | DISSECT. SCISSORS, FINE, CVD., 18CM |PLA-RE00-076 ~ |DE I 6208 | 595968
140122024 |540 [11-942-18-07 |TC-DISSECTING SCISSORS, STR., 18 CM |PLA-RE00-077 ____|oE ~_|e4 |PC 14308 | 1344764
140122024 |550 |11-961-18-07 |TC-DISS. SCISSORS, FINE, CVD., 18CM |PLA-RE00-078 / 16748 | 23,782.16
140122024 560 |24-850-25-07 |Micro scissors, Yasargil bay.str.,22.5cm PLA-RE00-079 ol 376.60 | 46,321.80
140122024 570 |99-999-99-99 |NOBD ~  |PLA-RE00-080 72 S e
140122024 |580 |99-999-99-99 |[NOBID Tels PLA-RE00-081 D [ s
140122024 |590 |11-495-17-07 |SCISSORS, DEAN, ANGLED UPW., 17.5 CNPLA-RE00-082 145.00 i ~ 12,615.00
140122024 600 |11-226-16-07 |SCISSORS, KELLY, STR., 16 CM PLA-RE00-08; A 98.00 16,072.00
R =S / \ 7Y Commercial Agencies Lig SRR Y




140122024 610 |11-359-15-07  |DISSECTING SCISSORS, KILNER, CVD., 1{PLA-RE00-084 DE 133 [PC [ 118.00 15,694.00
140122024 |620 |99-999-99-99 |NO BID o PLA-RE00-085 DE PC o B R

140122024 630 |21-165-18-07 |BANDAGE SCISSORS, LISTER, 18.5 CM _|PLA-RE00-086 ~_|BE 154 |PC [ 34.48 5,309.92
140122024 1640 |11-285-18-07 |DISSECTING SCISSORS, CVD., 18CM  |PLA-RE00-087 DE 213 |PC [ 34.00 7,242.00
140122024 650 |99-999-99-99 |NO BID ~ |PLA-RE00-088 DE S R e | K
140122024 660 |99-999-99-99 |NO BID = PLA-RE00-089 DE o S|BGE 7
140122024 670 |11-760-09-07 |MICRO SCISSORS, SH/SH, STR., 10 CM |PLA-RE00-090 ~_|bE 99 |PC \ 23780 | 2354220
140122024 (680 |11-741-11-07 |STRABISMUS SCISSORS, CVD., 11.5CM |PLA-RE00-091 DE 1103 |PC [ 260.78 26,860.34
140122024 (690 |99-999-99-99 |NO BID PLA-RE00-092 DE . |RG . s T F e
140122024 700 |11-326-14-07 |DISSECT. SCISSORS, FINE, STR., 14.5 CMPLA-RE00-093 DE 126 |PC 99.00 12,474.00
140122024 |710 |11-513-18-07 |NASAL SCISSORS, HEYMANN, SERR., 18 (PLA-RE00-095 |DE 85 _|PC 124.28 10,563.80
140122024 720 |11-509-10-07  |Scissor, Nose, Cottle-M., sh., cvd.,10cm  |PLA-RE00-096 _|DE 96 |PC 38.68 A4 3,713.28
140122024 730 |11-513-14-07  |Scissor, Nose, Aufricht, cvd., 14 cm PLA-RE00-098 MY 80 |PC 6280 5,024.00
140122024 740 |11-351-14-07  |SCISSORS, JOSEPH, SH/SH, CVD., 14.5 C|PLA-RE00-099 DE |81 jpc | 42000 | = 972000
140122024 750 |11-170-14-07  |SCISSORS, MAYO, STR., 14.5CM PLA-RE00-100 IDE |90 |PC_ 99.00 . 891000
140122024 760 |11-317-11-07  |NASAL SCISSORS, CINELLI, 11.5CM  |PLA-RE00-101 i WBEN. 105 |PC 148.00  15540.00
140122024 (770 | |11-514-19-07 _ |Scissor, Cart., McIndoe, str., 19 cm |PLA-RE00-102 BT ) 89 |PC | 147.00 13,083.00
140122024 |780 |11-359-12-07 |DISSECTING SCISSORS, KILNER, CVD., 1{PLA-RE00-104 DE 1[92 |PC 199.00 ~9,108.00
140122024 |790 |11-517-11-07  |SCISSORS, CONVERSE, BL/BL, 10.5CM |PLA-RE00-105 BE.____ 94 |PC 98.00 9,212.00
140122024 800 |11-678-10-07 |Scissor, Stevens, bl/bl, str., 10 cm |PLA-RECO-106 ~ |DE 159 |PC | 123.00 19,557.00
140122024 810 TENOTOMY SCISSORS, SH/SH, STR., 11 GPLA-RE00-107 DE 160 |PC 12200 | 19,52000
140122024 820 SCISSORS, REYNOLDS, CVD., 15.5CM  |PLA-RE00-108 |DE 84 |PC 84.82 | 712488
140122024 830 |11-326-14-07  |DISSECT. SCIS FINE, STR., 14.5 CM PLA-RE00-110 DE 1145 |PC 12400 |  17,980.00
140122024 840 |99-999-99-99 |NO BID 3 v PLA-RECO-114 ~  |DE e | PC g
140122024 850 |03-015-00-02 |NOBID™™ PLA-RE00-119 DE PC i T
140122024 | 1270 |99-999-99-99 INOBID =t PLA-RE00-120 __BE | |\PC

140122024 1280 [99-999-99-99 |NO §|D _|PLA-RE00-121 DE PC i

140122024 |1290 | Cleft Plate surgery Set PLA-RE00-122 |54

140122024 1300 |10-130-03-07 | SCALPEL HANDLE, NO. 3, 12 )CM 54 8.08

140122024 1310 [11-630-11-07 |IRIS SCISSORS, SHISH, STR, 11.5CM | 25.98

140122024 1320 |12-370-15-07  |Diss. forceps, Gillies, 1x2 T., 15,5 cm 23.42

140122024 {1330 |12-170-15-07 |DRESSING FORCEPS, MCINDOE, 15CM | 1 35.98

140122024 |1340 |15-166-16-07 |HOOKLET, SENN-MUELLER, SHARP, 16 CA 29.10

140122024 |1350 |28-207-18-07  |SKIN HOOKLET, GILLIES, NO.1,18CM | 31.58

140122024 |1360 |37-708-14-07 |HOOKLET, SHARP, 2-PR., 14.5 CM 66.38

140122024 1370 |20-631-13-07 | TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, KILNER, BAYON., 14 . 150.00

140122024 1380 |20-632-12-07 | TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, DERF, 12 CM 225.00

140122024 11390 |18-523-10-01  |Suction tube, Frazier, 3.3 mm, 19.5cm | cm 30.06

140122024 1400 |37-557-22-07 |Elevator, Howarth, 23 cm 89.82

140122024 1410 39-101-18-07 _|PALATAL RASPATORY, CVD. L., 4 MM, 14 C 88. 20

D= S
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140122024 [1420]30-102-18-07 |PALATAL RASPATORY, CVD.R. 4MM,14C  [DE 54 [ST 8820 476280
140122024 1440 |38-224-00-07 | MOUTH GAG, DINGMANN, COMPLETE | - T DB 54 ST | 240000 | 12980000
140122024 1450 43-283-04-07 | MITCHELL-SCALER, ROUND HANDLE : DE |54 ST 28.86 155844 |
R I | , ekt RREVEDIRIE NN | feEr | ewt® | 0000 |
140122024 1470 ‘BGSIC Plastic SurgerySet  |PLA-RE00-123 | 91 it o,
140122024 1480 [10-130-03-07 | SCALPEL HANDLE, NO. 3, 2eM | fe sz L= = 3| DE |91 ST 808 | 7%28
140122024 |1490 |10-130-05-07 | SCALPEL HANDLE, NO. 3, CM-SCALE, 12¢ DE 182 ST 874 | 159068
140122024 1500 10-100-04-07 |SCALPELHANDLE,NO. 4, 135CM | e 808 73528 |
140122024 [1510 |10-137-07-07 |SCALPEL HANDLE, NO.7,S0LID, 16CM | : DE o1 [sT | 1868 | 169988
140122024 |1520 |11-171-14-07 SCISSORS, MAYO, CVD., 14.5 CM Ry DE 1 22.96 208936
140122024 1530 11-690-11-07 _|STRABISMUS SCISS,, BLBL, STR., (T e lot IsT | 9980 | 908180
140122024 1540 11-691-11-07 |STRABISMUS SCISS., BLBL, CVD, 11.5C1 DE 91 *|ST | 10168 | 925288
140122024 1550 |11-630-11-07 _|IRIS SCISSORS, 'SHISH, STR., 11.5CM s - - APEC a0 IS 25.98 236418
140122024 1560 |11-943-18-07 _ TC-Dissecting Scissors, cvd. 18em | ~ |oE 9t ST | 15736 | 1431976
140122024 1570 |11674-10-07 | SC-Scissors, Stevens, shish, str.1tom DE 91 |sT ~ 59.26 539266
140122024 (1580 |12-368-12-07 | TISSUE FORCEPS, ADSON, 1X2T, 12CM — my et T 1530 1,392.30
140122024 |1590 09-003-53-07 |Forceps, Adson, perfor, X2, 12cm Gk DE |91 ST 7838 713288
140122024 11600 12-400-12-07 _|FORCEPS, ADSON BROWN, 12 N[ o MY 91 |sT 39.56 359996 |
140122024 1610 [12-370-15-07  Diss. forceps, Gillies, 1x2T., 155em R S| - AN [ B2 | M
140122024 |1620 [13-311-12:07 |HAEM. FORCEPS, MOSQUITO, CVD., 12C, MY 455 |ST 208 | 1277640
140122024 1630 15-166-16-07 |HOOKLET, SENN-MUELLER, SHARP, 16 C o e T 29.10 5,296.20
140122024 |1640 [15-315-18-07 |RETRACTOR, KOCHER, 41X18 MM, 23 CM DE 182 [sT | 7840 1426880
140122024 1650 [15-315-25-07 |RETRACTOR, KOCHER, 61X25 MM, 23CM = DE 182 |ST 7840 1426880 |
140122024 11660 [15-750-13-07 \WOUNDSPREADER, SHARP, 3X4 T, 185Gy, o=~ MY 8 |ST 14232 1295112 |
140122024 |1670 [28-207-18-07 | SKIN HOOKLET, GILLIES, NO. 1, 18 CW/ T DE 182 |ST | 3158 | 5747.56
140122024 1680 |37-708-14-07 |HOOKLET, SHARP, 2-PR., 145CM | T &y, DE 182 |ST 66.38 12,081.16 |
140122024 (1690 14-370-18-07 |SPONGE FORCEPS, RAMPLEY, STR, 86~ "1, DE  [te2 lsT | 12586 290652
140122024 {1700 |13-915-08-07 | TOWEL FORCEPS, BACKHAUS, SHARP.9| My  |182 |ST .58 | 483038
140122024 |1710 |30-131-15-07 _|Forceps, tissue, Alls, 2x3t, 155em | . [DE of (8T | 12798 11,582.48
140122024 1720 (09-006-03-07 | Tissue Forceps, Lane, 1x2T, 14 cm e DE 91 ST 8308 | 756028
140122024 |1730 |20-336-13-07 |NEEDLEHOLDER, NEIVERT, GROOVED, 1 I ¢ 2 ot st 125.26 11,398.66
140122024 1740 [20-604-13-07 | TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, WEBSTER, 13CM | B e b1 & | e ] - d6dB(e
140122024 (1750 43-283-04-07 |MITCHELL-SCALER, ROUNDHANDLE | DE 91 ST 28.86 262626
140122024 1760 |23-356-21-07 BONE CURETTE, OVALROUND, 21 CM _ T v B e BF 1 RS 6,349.98

& : 0 I T Y7 N .
140122024 |1780 |03-004-00-03 __LINO_ELAgIYj‘L B ST -
140122024 (1790 |10-137-71-07 | SCALPEL HANDLE NO. 7K, SOLID,SHORT,{ ISt ] 808 - | 100488
140122024 |1800 |11-350-14-07 | SCISSORS, JOSEPH, SHISH, STR., 14.5Ch ST agra L. 69538 )
140122024 |1810 | 11-351-14-07 SCISSORS, JOSEPH, SH/SH, CVD., 14.5 C ST 59.56 3,156.68
140122024 |1820 11-607-15-07 | NASAL SCISSORS, FOMON, KNEE BENT, ST | 8876 | 470428 |
140122024 1830 |11-511-18-07 NASALSCISSORS HEYMANN, 18 CM, ST 85.20 4,515.60 ,

V.
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[11-910-17-07
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11900
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13-311-12-07
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20-638-15-07
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PERIOST ELEVATOR, JOSEPH, 6.5 MM, 18

TC-SCISSORS, MAYO, STR., 17 CM =
DRESSING F FORCEPS, ADSON, 12 CM
TISSUE FORCEPS, ADSON, 1X2T., 12 CM
HAEM. FORCEPS, MOSQUITO, STR., 12.5
HAEM. FORCEPS, MOSQUITO, CVD., 120
Suction tube, Frazier, @ 3.3 mm, 19.5 cm

| TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, CRILE-WOOD, 15 CI\

BONE CUTT. FORCEPS, COTTLE-KAZAN. \

[EAR FORCEPS, GRUENWALD, BAYON., 1

Speculum, nasal, Killian, 50 mm, #2

Speculum, nasal, Killian, 75 mm, #3 I
NASAL SPEC., VIENNA-TYPE, 30 MM, 13.5
NASAL CUTTING FORCEPS, KNIGHT, 17
SEPTUM FCPS., BRUENINGS, NO. 2, 16.5
RHINOPLASTIC KNIFE, JOSEPH, NO. 1
RHINOPLASTIC KNIFE, JOSEPH,NO.2 |
RHINOPLAST. KNIFE, JOSEPH, STR., 15.5
IRHINOPLASTIC KNIFE, COTTLE, STR., 15
Knife, Mucosa, Freer, 155¢cm ! .
SWIVEL KNIFE, BALLENGER, STR., 3 MM
|SWIVEL KNIFE, BALLENGER, STR., 4 MM

ELEVATOR, MCKENTY, 4 MM, 20.5 CM

Osteotome, Cottle, gradu., 4 mm, 18,5 cm
Osteotome, Cottle, gradu., 7 mm, 18.5 cm
NASAL SAW, JOSEPH, ANGLED LEFT, 17 €
NASAL SAW, JOSEPH, ANGLED RIGHT, 17,
CARTILAGE CRUSHER, COTTLE, W. CLIP|
GLABELLUM RASP, AUFRICHT, PUSH, 21
NASAL RASP, FOMON, DOUBLE-ENDED, 2
MUCOUS HOOKLET, JOSEPH, SHARP, 15.¢
NASAL RETRACT., AUFRICHT, 45X11 MM, '
SKIN HOOKLET, JOSEPH, 2-PR., 5 MM, 16
ALAR RETRACTOR, FOMON, BL., 2-PR., 1€
RETRACTOR, COTTLE-NEIV., GROOVE, 1¢
HOOKLET, BLUNT/SHARP, 2-PR., 14.5 CM
HOOKLET, SHARP/BLUNT, 2-PR., 14.5 CM |
@gIRACTOR NEIVERT, W. GROOVE, 17 C
|SEPTUM STRAIGHTENING FCPS., STR., 2|
SEPTUM STRAIGHT. FORCEPS, ASCH, 22

ol
~t5>-

53 |ST 14718 | 780054
53 [ST 12.12 642.36
53 |sT 15.30 810.90
318 |ST 26.08 8,293.44
318 ST | 28.08 _8,929.44
55 |ST 30.06 159318 |
53 ST 101.00 5,353.00
53 ST 216.86 11,493.58
1106 [sT | 2634 2,792.04
53 |ST 179.28 950184 |
|53 |sT 179.28 9,501.84
53 |sT 175.28 9,280.84
53 |sT 400.00 21,200.00
53 |sST 277.32 14,697.96
53 |sT 64.90 343970
53 |sT 6490 3,439.70
53 ST 59.16 3,135.48
53 |ST 58.52 3,101.56
53 ST | 7950 421350
53 |sT 181.18 9,602.54
53 |sT | 18118 | 9,602.54
53 ST 121.00 6,413.00
153 ST | 7682 |
53 |ST 4830 |
53 |sT 48.30 i
53 |sT 15000
|53 |sT | 155.00
53 ST | 15626 |
110.12
125.00
34.28
93.76
576 | 5
719 3,813.88
1608 | = 615224
66.38 3,518.14
66.38 3518.14
| 10328 5473.84 _—
[ 273.28 i 14,483:84
| 23336 12%
5,340“Ef""'7“‘-\‘ )

v

—



(

140122024 [2260 [03-019-00-09 |LIPOSUCTION - LL ~ [PLA-RE00-126 “[oE |51 JsT S D
140122024 [227010-130-03-07 | SCALPEL HANDLE, NO. 3, 12 CM DE 51 |sT 808 | 412.08
140122024 2280 |10-149-03-07  |Scalpel handle, long, fine, 22,5 cm B DE 51 |sT 15.68 799.68
140122024 2290 |13-915-08-07 |TOWEL FORCEPS, BACKHAUS, SHARP, 9 whd! MY 51 |sT 25.48 1,209.48
140122024 2320 |18-100-16-07 | Cannula, Lipo, Triport, LL, @2,0mm, 15cm DE 51 ST | 14658 7,475.58
140122024 [2330 18-100-20-07 _|Cannula, Lipo, Triport, LL, @3,0mm, 15cm | |DE 51 |ST 139.26 7,102.26
140122024 (2340 18-100-22-07 _|Cannula, Lipo, Triport, LL, @3 0mm, 20cm | 0 A N A ) 51 sT 13926 710226
140122024 2350 |18-100-24-07 |Cannula, Lipo, Triport, LL, @3,0mm, 30cm 3 DE 51 |sT 13926 7,102.26
140122024 2360 |18-100-36-07 |Can., Lipo, Monoport, LL, @2,0mm, 15cm e DE |51 |sT 14658 |  7475.58
140122024  |2370 |18-100-40-07 _ |Can., Lipo, Monoport, LL, @3,0mm, 15cm . |DE 51 ST 139.26 7,102.26
140122024 2380 |18-100-42-07 _ |Can., Lipo, Monoport, LL, @3,0mm, 20cm Ny DE |51+ [sT 13926 | 7,102.26
140122024 2390 18-100-44-07 |Can., Lipo, Monoport, LL, @3,0mm, 30cm . DE |51 |sT 139.26 7,102.26
140122024 2440 18-100-94-07 _ |Can,, Inf, 22 L, LL, baj, 83,0mm, 20om | DE 51 |ST  174.00 8,874.00
140122024 2450 |18-100-95-07 | Can., Inf,, 22 L, LL, baj, @4,0mm, 20cm SIS DE 51 |sT 17400 | 8,874.00
140122024 2460 |20-642-18-07 TC-NEEDLEHOLDER, MAYO-HEGAR, 18.5 MY 51 ST 106.44 | 5428.44
140122024 2470 |56-231-06-01 | BOWL, METAL, H= 30, @ 61 MM, 0.07L | S o [8EL 102_[sT _ 1388 [ 141372
140122024 2480 |55-804-50-01 |marTray, DIN, 477x251x64 mm =T R, I DE 51 /ST 18282 | 19,323.82
s F S YRR ) | seT 1,842.94 e
14122024 (3810 _ |Basic set for microsurgery instrument  |PLA-RE00-128 | B 187 | e - 85
14122024 |3820 |12-414-11-07 |FORCEPS, JEWELER, STR., NO. 5, 11 CM T MY By fsT - 5972 | 220964
14122024 |3830 |12-410-12-07 |FORCEPS, JEWELER, STR., NO. 3, 12 CM MY - ocsr ST | ef06 | 225922
14122024 3840 |12-409-12-07 [FORCEPS, JEWELER, CVD.,NO.7,12CM| | My T, 4 7680 | 284160
14122024 3850 |12-560-02-07 | DILATING-FORCEPS, 10°, 5X0.2 MM, 11 C\ DE 3 [sT 18000 | 6,660.00
14122024 |3860 [20-302-01-07 |MICRO NEEDLEH., STR., W/O LOCK, 13 CI DE ~ a7 IsT 460.00 L 17,020.00
14122024 (3870 [20-013-18-07 |MICRO NEEDLEHHOLDER, CVD., W/O LO o R - - sz _IsT_— 40800 | 15,096.00
14122024 |3880 |12-418-11-07 | Forceps, Jeweler, ang. down, 11 cm |DE 37 |sT 136.70 1,357.90
14122024 (3890 |11-710-15-07 |MICRO SCISS., SHISH, STR., 15 CM ; DE a7 lsT 275.00 ~10,175.00
14122024 (3900 24-850-03-07 | Micro scissors, Vannas, cvd., 12 cm e ~bE 37 ST 330.00 12,210.00
14122024 [3910 09-005-09-07 | Micro-Singleclip, Acland, A, 8 mm | - DE 137 |2eR 97.12 3,593.44
14122024 3920 |09-005-11-07 | Micro-Singleclip, Acland, A, 11 mm S DE 37 [26R | 88.02 3,256.74
14122024 |3930 |09-005-15-07 | Micro-Singleclip, Acland, A, 17 mm { ; - DE |37 [2kR 840 | 315980
14122024 (3940 |09-005-08-07 | Micro-Singleclip, Acland, V, 8 mm 5 b DE 37 |26R | 9112 3,593.44
14122024 3950 |09-005-10-07 | Micro-Singleclip, Acland, V, 11 mm |pE 37 [2ER - 88.02 3,266.74
14122024 |3960 |09-005-14-07  |Micro-Singleclip, Acland, V, 17 mm i DE 37 2R 85.40 ~3,159.80
14122024 |3970 |09-005-41-07 | Approximator, Acland, A, 8 mm 37 |sT 200.00 740000 |
14122024 (3980 |09-00543-07 | Approximator, Acland, A, 11 mm 4 Sl _ Jsz_TIsT 20000 | 7,400.00
o o | == SR SET | 28235 | T
14122024 4040 99-999-99-99 NO BID PLA-RE00-129 o ST El |
14122024 14050 |99-999-99-99 [NOBID PLA-RE00-130/ | & ST ﬂ L
14122024 1406099-999-9999 |NOBID o PLA-RE00-131] " ST, Z. D
'
14122024 [407099-999-99-99 |NO BID _|PLAREOO-12  DE ST =
14122024 |4230 11-280-18-07 _[Scissors, diss. Metzenb, billstr. 18cm  |PLAREOO-103  [DE |sT ]
14122024 4240 [99-999-99-99 INO BID ~ |pLaDs00-009 DE ST ]
14122024 4250 [99-999-99-99 |NO BID __|PLA-DS00-008 DE ST —
ST PO | et € B2 |
TOTAL: 1,819,890.78
I

.QuickLase -



1 2 3 4 5 6
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
OidNational | MNew Seller | tem

code i code No. DOP | icidental | DOPat | o ooe
Unit cip at | servicesas | End-user, dallveiv at

Product Pack price | End- | definedin | site & End*g.r

size (USD) | user, | scheduleof | Incidental USD!
site | Requirement |  garies site. (USD)

r i Clamp microsurgery double
PLA-RE00-011 QL-786-12-74 1 venous 25mm 75gm Pcs 7 UK. $51.31 N/A N/A N/A $4,053.49
3 i Clamp microsurgery double with
PLA-RE00-012 QL-786-12-57 2 suture Arterial 14mm 35mg Pcs 8 UK. $51.31 N/A N/A N/A $4,258.73
Clamp microsurgery double
PLA-RE00-013 QL-786-12-67 3 Arterial 77mm 45mg Pcs 88 UK. $51.31 N/A N/A N/A $4,515,28
PLAREDOO1 |  QL7861275 o 4 | Clamp microsurgery double ps | 00 | uk 5131 | NA | NA $3591.70
Arterial 25mm 75mg - i o
C 7

T
P SO TR

-




1 2 3 4 5 6
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
Old National il Seller
code codé code DDP | |ncidental DDP at on ClPlfree
Unit ciP at | servicesas | End-user, délveryat
Product Pack price End- | definedin | site& - nd_uf.""
size (UsD) user, | scheduleof | Incidental ite USD'
site | Requirement | Series site. (USD)
Clamp microsurgery (venous)
Approximator rte. size 14 mm, 25
QL-786-12-58 s
Alternative Alternative
Clamp microsurgery (venous)
PLA-RE00-015 QL786-12-66 :;pm""“m' rte.sae32wm, 45 | ps | 7 UK. 131 | N/A $3,694.32
Alternative Al
x 4 Clamp microsurgery (venous)
Ql-786:12:82 Approximator rte. size 35 mm, 75
mg
PLA-RE00-016 QL-786-01-80 :r’:f':h walteorwatsonskingraft | oo | 25 UK. $71.43 N/A N/A N/A $17,857.50
ELEVATORS & RASPATORIES
PLAREOO-0L7 |  QL-786-21-557 Freer double ended elev and Pes | 156 UK. $2632 N/A N/A N/A $4,105.92
P (72 PLA-REOO-018 | QL-786-14-563 ::;”;"h rasal aspatorydouble o g UK. $2871 N/A N/A N/A $2,440.35
° N
s G \ PLAREOG02L | QL7860943 | fg::eﬁ b Ps | 190 | uk | $1875 | NA | NA % $3,56250
— .' > / A@
79 % ALZN .4




1 2 3V ] 4 5 6
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
OldNational | o Soller | ltem
code Zoda code No. DDP | |ncidentat | DDPat on CIP/ffree
Unit cip at | servicesas | End-user, delivery at
Product Pack price End- | definedin site & Radimer
size (USD) | user, | scheduleof | Incidental | . e
ite. | Requirement |  Soriog | Site: (USD)
PLAREOG022 | QL78615:216 | 10 | Kilnerskin hook 7" s | 163 | UK @ | Na | NA N/A $5,341.51
waaaoin | Gomisel | 4 | VEDRREHRRR pes | 141 | UK so154 | NA | NA N/A $12,007.14
12cm curved
PLAREDO028 | Q7860653 | 12 | MicroAdson forceps 12em Pes | 154 | UK $2651 N/A/WN/A $4,082.54
Q €,
N A‘,
PLAREOO030 | QL7B6GROL | 13 | Microgroovedissectingforceps | Pcs | 100 | UK. $6392 o[ A A $6,392.00
o |l () ol
Micro- Jeweller forceps straight al\ " [N ¢
PARENGH | Q7SS | M | g pes | 12 | Uk | s | NWC\ NA M | $sases
] e\ i
\‘b‘ ‘\1'/ m
PLAREOGO3 | QL7865387 | 15 |Micro-Jewellerforcepsilem | Pes | 105 | UK. W | NA W“f N/A $4,387.95
PLAREOO-033 | QL78606153 | 16 x&:w"'"m'ww‘ Pes | 165 | UK 5765 | NA | NA N/A $9,512.25
7
&% i
A, | oo | asessus | 17 Brown-Adson, multipleteeth | Pes | 123 | UK. s | NA | NA $5,381.25
' ;\3 AN /— \ 1
5 4 ! 1 .AW‘




ki AL % |
1 2 3 3 4 5 6
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
OidNational | A€W Seller | ftom
code code code No. DDP | |ncidental | DDPat on ClP/free
Unit ciP at | servicesas | End-user, delivery at
Product Pack price End- | definedin | site& End-uest
size (USD) | user, | schedule of | Incidental et
site | Roquirement | *gerigq | Site. (USD)
Harrison dissecting forceps fine
PARO0Y | QL7BeHRaz | 18 | Mo rmn s | 17 | uk 452 [ NA | NA N/A $5,559.84
PLAREOO-038 | QL78614701 | 19 | Lembert bone rongeur Ps | 76 | uk $878 | N/A )&-N N/A §7,507.28
qer St. N
Til nasaldressing f (° &
PLAREOO03) | QL786021408 | 20 en:’,“’“ reshglocensiiee | ps | o | uk | s N/Y v //ﬁ\ W\ | s
Pl
& IC -
PAREOON0 | Quissorss | 21 :ascckr:auspedlamcww'-"h’“” Pes | 161 | UK $1751 N/\% kQ)A‘ 26 )/;\:‘) $2,819.11
; - 2
\'& Y
PLA-RE00-041 QL-786-KL-03 22 | Kilner artery forceps Pes 61 UK. $13.65 N/A Qj S W, $832,65
LS
s Millard dissecting forceps skin
PLAREOG042 | QL786-MD04 | 23 i s | 13 | uk s | NA | NA N/A $4,943.75
PLAREOO-0A3 |  QL78618.02 * | g4 | Alistissueforceps 5em Ps | 13 | uk 3121 | NA | N N/A $3,846.21
(2(3teeth)
(/4
LR, PLAREOOMSS |  QL7850615 | 25 | Delicate issecting forceps Ps | 9% | uk 581 || NA | MA A $5,469.38
4 >\’ A /]
. N nl/%




1 2 3 4 5 6
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
Old National g Seller ltem
code code No. DDP | incidental | DDPat
code on ClP/free
Unit cIP at | servicesas | End-user, Renat
Product Pack price | End- | definedin | site8 | nd_u':“
size (UsD) user, | scheduleof | Incidental ito USD’
site | Requirement |  gerigs | Site-(USD)
PLA-RE00-046 QL-786-NT-05 26 | Non traumatic dissecting forceps | Pcs 121 UK. $29.94 N/A N/A N/A $3,622.74
PLA-RE00-047 QL-786-06-111 27 | Delicate tissue forceps Pcs 138 UK. $29.32 N/A m\’wk $4,046.16
/ b %
N %
PLA-RE00-048 QL-786-06-83 28 | Tissue forceps Pes 165 UK $2831 ﬁ&’ / N[A \ $4,671.15
S [Quick | | =
2 w
PLA-RE00-049 QL-786-07-34 29 | Delicate Haemostatic forceps Pcs 153 UK. $29.76 k&; N/ / 8\% $4,553.28
et
>y R
= . : (P
) PAREOCS) | Qu7ses04 | 3o | MestonalandtisueGrasoing | oo |y | ouk | a7 | NA NQUEY NA $3,945.09
D\ forceps
=
L NEEDLE HOLDER Crile murray
R \ PLA-RE00-051 QL-786-10-01 31 wioale holdis Pcs 249 UK. 961.25 N/A N/A N/A $15,251.25
)
* De bakey 18cm microvascular
- PLA-RE00-052 QL-786-11-95A 32 needle holder Pcs 106 UK $4233 N/A N/A N/A $4,486.98
)
'/ V
) PLA-RE00-053 QL-786-11-15A 33 | Needle holder Kilner Pcs 119 UK. $42.33 N/A N/A }ﬁ/ $5,037.27
A




3

1 2 4 6
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
0Old National Na':I'o“ml Seller Item
code ot code No. - . D.D'P ::Is:m::
Product Pack price | End- End _'g. .
size (USD) | user, ite USD'
site site. (USD)
PLA-RE00-054 QL-786-11-158 34 | Needle holder Micro-Kilner 13cm | Pes 116 UK. $42.33 N/A $4,910.28
PLA-RE00-055 QL-786-10-08 35 | Needle holder Derft micron Pes 90 UK. $4233 N/A [ e, A $3,809.70
i n
23 4 3 ; Needle holder micro tungsten A
« € PLA-RE00-056 QL-786-11-11 36 carbide jaw Pcs 89 UK $78.2 A:\ $6,961.58
L] >
5 0
f;f ; \ PLAREDODS? | QL7619 | 37 ;:f:"l'z' 5"°"’°’ nderimero]TC | o | s | uk | $ma $,101.16
< X
Needle holder
/p . \ PLA-RE00-058 QL-786-11-100 k1 ryder(microlT.Cjaw 15m Pcs 60 UK §78.21 $4,692.60
\ 'Y
/ ; i Needle holder-scissors olson
) PLA-RE00-059 QL-786-11-40 39 hegar T.Caw Pes 96 UK $42.99 N/A $4,127.04
PLA-RE00-060 QL-786-10-02 40 | Crile-wood needle holder 6" Pcs 76 UK. $4.50 N/A $342,00
PLA-RE00-061 QL-786-10-13 41 | Neivert needle holder 5" Pcs 64 UK. $31.97 N/A r $2,046,08
B |
— | 7
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el R TN
1 2 3 4 5 6
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
Old National Naﬂmo'ml Seller Item
code code code No. DDP | |ncidental | DDPat on ClPffree
Unit CIP at | servicesas | End-user, delivry at
Product Pack price End- | definedin | site& ey
size (USD) | user, | scheduleof | Incidental | o icpy
site | Requirement |  Serigs . (USD)
Olsen-Hegar needle holder &
PLA-RE00-062 QL-786-11-29 LY cissor TC 14em Pcs 67 UK. $35.65 N/A N/A N/A $2,388.55
qn
Troutman micro needle holder b
PLA-RE00-063 QL-786-PL-24 3 angleon fatwithoutcate Pes 56 UK. $96.75 & $5,418.00
3
=)
{ &= r
p E‘ %
r o PLA-RE00-064 QL-786-10-10 44 | Webster needle holder 4" Pes 85 UK. $46.71 N $3,970.35
A
P
\‘7 PLA-RE00-065 QL-786-11-99A 45 | Ryder needle holder 4" Pes 60 UK. $36.71 N/A N/A N/A $2,202.60
A T
¥ ™
PLA-RE00-066 QL-786-11-100A 46 | Ryder needle holder serrated 6" Pes 73 UK. $37.92 N/A N/A /Nﬁ/ $2,768.16
s y A /] /—\
> NAY/S /]




\<&!

1 2 3 4 5 6
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
0ld National Al Seller item
code code code No. DDP | |ncidentas | DDPat on ClPffree
Unit CIP at | servicesas | End-user, delivery at
Product Pack price | End- | definedin | sited | £ dg“
size (UsD) user, | scheduleof | Incidental 4
site | Requirement | ~ Serigs | it (USD)
QL786-MN-06 Needle holder fine tip (Webster)
Alternative
ARbrrisive Needle holder fine tip (Halsey)
PLAREODOG7 | QULZBSMNOT | 47 | bt Ps | 91 UK. $14.11 N/A N/A N/A $1,284.01
Alternative
QL786-MN-08 Needle holder fine tip (Mayo
Hegar Plastic) /
¢ St. Ca,
PLA-RE00-068 QL-786-5L-07 P i Ps | 1901 | UK $794 N/;/oo“' "0»6 A $15,093.94
i S/ N4
=% [g]
4 &= PLAREOO0S) | Q7S48 | g | MemmerforhandsueryISS e | | uk $61.11 /8 ( mc\( N $6,538.77
: W QL-786-20-225 Urethral dilators / male - [
f" o~ PLA-RE00-070 Alternative 50 | Alternative pes | 1 UK. $2238 N WA K $3,826.98
=B Q1-786-20-225A Urethral dilators / female 2 S~
/A o/
P & PLA-RE00-073 QL-786-5T-08 51 | Self clearing suction tube Pes | 181 UK. $35.00 N/A N/A $3942.18
/) PLARECO074 | QL-786-14-677A | 52 i‘:;::f“s Brarc pranians s | 79 UK. $10000 | N/A N/A N/A $4,994.38
PLARECO-076 | QL-786-04-154 | 53 | Metzenbaum-Fino scissor Pes | 96 Uk, $0227 N/A N/A N/A $2,734.08




AS! e AR 1 §
1 2 3 4 5 8
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
OidNatioral | | Ne¥ Seller | Item
code code code No. DDP | |ncidental | DDPat on ClP/free
Unit CIP at | servicesas | End-user, delivery at
Product Pack price | End- | definedin | site & EM"J“
size (UsD) user, | schedule of | |ncidental ite, USD'
site | Requirement | ggrieg | Site: (USD)
PLAREOO0T? | QL7051 | 54 sc”::;“b‘"’“'s“‘“'b“’”‘“ Ps | 94 | uk | $s000 | MA| wa N/A $4993.28
Metzenbaum fino tungestin
PALREOTS | Q7860565 | 55 | e o wn Pes | 142 | uk | $10000 $8,686.14
Micro straight blades, bayonet
PAREIOOTS | QL7153 | 56 | M i Ps | 123 | uk | s2s000 $19,649.25
L] “;
2 Micro-Straight blades bevelled at
i b\\ PLAREOO-0S0 | Q78615381 | 57 S L Ps | 19 | uk | $25000 $19,01025
29
2 Micro vannas staight i
j PLAREO-081 | QL786-15272 | 58 m’;"‘“"" P fems Pes | 106 | uk | $15000 $9,770.02
1
/\ ' PLAREOO-0S2 | QL786:04204 | 59 2‘;;:"‘"""‘“""‘" s | 87 | uk | $ts000 $7,795.20
[l
/ PLAREOO-083 | QL-78504214 | 60 | Fine-Pointed scissors Pes | 164 | UK | S10000 | WA | WA N/A $9,539.88
PLAREOO0SS |  QL7860457 | 61 2&:‘:"“""“"“‘"‘”'"‘" Pes | 13 | UK | $12000 | WA | NaA NA | 5959329

B G~ ¢




1 2 3 4 5 6
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
Old National " mﬂ Seller Item
code code code No. DDP | |ncidenta | DDPat on ClP/free
Unit CIP at | servicesas | End-user, delivery at
Product Pack price End- | definedin site & B Mv:g“
size (UsD) user, | schedule of | Incidental S
site | Requirement | gorigg | Site. (USD)
PLAREOO-0SS | QL78MCO | 62 i':::‘"‘"”“m""“e“im“s Ps | 18 | UK $10000 | N/A NA N/A $7,331.34
PLAREO0-0B6 | QL-786-04-416 | 63 | Listers bandage scissors Ps | 14 | UK $3500 | NA N/A N/A $3,350.04
P St 0
/ A e
. oo »,
r PLAREOO-087 | QL7860413 | 64 | Dressingscissors s | a3 | uk $3500 | N/A / > )(N \rﬂ\ $4,426.14
. A\ “
: i rved ] ick g
Frf PLAREO0-088 | QL786-15272C | 65 ::l;:r"‘"“a““ ety Ps | 13 | Uk | $s000 | WA @M\E‘m‘gA ol s1346098
N 0 4
/ \ A \ / _Qv
ﬂ PLA-RE00-089 QL-786-15-338 66 | Microvannas angled scissor Pcs 126 UK. $150.00 N/A Ql: P‘ $11,085.48
3 L <
® ) \_’- /
/j PLAREQO-090 | QL786-15307A | 67 | Micro scissor 10.5cm straight Pes | 99 UK. $12500 | N/A N/A N/A §7,635.87
7 "
PLAREOG091 | QL786-15-309 | 68 | Microscissor curved Pes | 103 | Uk $12500 | N/A N/A N/A $8,098.89
PLAREON092 | QL7BGVS10 | go | Microvascularadventitaliem |, o, UK. $15000__| N/A N/A NA L $685240
straight scissor /")
& d Z




1 ¥ 2 3 4 5 6
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
Old National N mi Seller Item
code code code No. DDP | |ncidentsl | DDPat on ClPfree
Unit cip at | servicesas | End-user, delivery at
Product Pack price | End- | definedin | sited | d*gﬂ
size (USD) | user, | scheduleof | Incidental ite, (USD!
site | Requirement | ~ gerigg | Site. (USD)
PLARECO-093 | QL786-0453 | 70 | Straightfine blunt scissor Ps | 16 | UK $10000 | N/A N/A N/A $7,914.06
PLAREO0-09S | QL-786-04198 | 71 | Angled onflat scissor Pes | 85 UK. $53.56 N/A $2,783.85
RN
o,
Alar cartilage scissors curved on
PAREOODS6 | QL78604286 | 72 | T Pes | 9% Uk, $36.86 \\/Xin $2,108.16
. : -
: & PLAREOS | Qu7B6As10 | 73 | Aufiehtdisedingeunedonfat | ool | | e wl 194640
shsor &
1 <
a
QL786AS11 | 74 | Aufricht dissectingfine scissor | Pes | 81 UK. $12500 | N/A “%;'//:N? $1,97073
L | S
‘—:7
f PLAREOO-100 | QL786-04-86 | 75 | Rounded blades scissor Pes | 90 UK. $10000 | N/A N/A N/A $5,382.90
:‘ PLA-REQ0-101 QL-786-C512 | 76 | Campbell thinoplasty 11.5 scissor | Pes | 105 UK. $15000 | N/A N/A N/A $9,294.60
PLAREON0? | QL78604287 | 77 | Cortiase fineserrated 18cm Pes | 8 | UK | $15000 | NA | NA NA L $7,74033
scissor /




1 2 3 4 5 6
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
d National ol Seller item
code code code No. DDP | |ncidental DDP at on ClPffree
Unit CiP at | servicesas | End-user, delivery at
Product Pack price | End- | definedin | sited | ‘oY
size (UsD) user, | scheduleof | Incidental i uU.S.Dh
site | Requirement |  Serjeg | Site: (USD)
PLA-RE00-104 QL-786-KL-13 78 | Kilner curved on flat scissor Pcs 92 UK. $100.00 N/A N/A N/A $5,350.72
PLA-RE00-105 QL-786-04-234 79 | Kilner angled scissor Pes 94 UK. $100.00 N/A m_ Fan, $5,467.04
TN
. PA
PLAREOC-06 | QL78604350 | go | Sevenstenotomysasoridam o | ge0 | oyk | sise0 | WA R WAL no || $11,33193
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PLA-RE00-108 QL-786-B5-15 82 | Barsky nasal scissor Pes 84 UK. $37.49 N/A i /A $1,826.16
PLA-RE00-110 QL-786-04-214 83 | Delicate scissor Pcs 145 UK. $125.00 N/A N/A N/A $10,895.30
N Bone hand surgery sets / Set
PLA-RE00-119 QL-RE00-119 85 | content details available in Set 82 UK. $1,610.13 N/A N/A N/A $132,030.66
technical offer
Cleft palate surgery sets various
PLA-RE00-122 QL-RE00-122 88 | instrument / Set content details Set 54 UK. $2,172.78 N/A N/A N/A $117,330.12
available in technical offer L~

P
P N



1 |l 2 3 4 5 6
Quantity
offered | Country
Brief Description of Goods & of Price per physical unit Total Price
physical | origin
unit
0ld National m’:,';"ﬂ Seller | Item
code code code No. DDP | |ncidentat | DDPat on ClPffree
Unit CIP at | servicesas | End-user, dolveryat
Product Pack price End- | definedin | site& End
size (USD) | user, | scheduleof | ncidental :
site | Requirement | ~ Series site. (USD)
Basic plastic surgery sets various
PLA-RE0C-123 QL-RE00-123 89 | instruments / Set content details | Set 91 UK. $1,325.43 N/A N/A N/A $120,614.13
available in technical offer
Rhinoiplasty sets various
PLA-RE0-124 QL-RE00-124 90 | instruments / Set content details | Set 53 UK. $3,16573 | N/A N/A N/A $167,783.69
™ available in technical offer
A= lipo suction set cannula / Set
P ) PLA-RE00-126 QL-RE00-126 91 | content details available in Set 51 UK. $1,237.60 N/A N/A N/A $63,117.60
po P technical offer
: [’ ] Basic set for microsurgery
% PLA-RE00-128 QL-RE00-128 93 | instrument / Set content details | Set 3 UK $2,155.98 N/A N/A N/A $79,771.26
il available in technical offer
T Tendon sur
gery set / Set content
. PLA-RE00-134 QL-RE00-134 9% detals availabl i technical ofer Set 80 Uk $552.31 N/A N/A N/A $44,184.80
£
) PLA-RE00-103 QL-786-04-154 99 | Metzenbaum scissor Pes 115 Uk $52.14 N/A N/A N/A $5,996.10

—— —

Grand Total of Bid price: § 1,236,548.38 (One Million Two Hundred Thirty-Six Thousand Five Hundred Forty-Eight Dollars and Thirty-Eight Cents
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we thank you for the enquiry and are offering:

T |

PLA-RE00-017 15-12-165 FREER septum elevat.shp/blunt, 185 mm 156 $41,20 $6.427,20
PLA-RE00-018 15-12-171 HOWARTH elevatorium double ended, 215 mm  |sharp-blunt 85 $44,90 $3.816,50
PLA-RE00-022 74.103.15 KILNER skin retractor 150 mm 163 538,70 $6.308,10
PLA-REQ0-027 02-04-333 micro forceps, cvd., 115 mm, 0,2 mm 141 $69,90 $9.855,90
PLA-RE00-028 02-04-220 MICRO-ADSON forceps w.plateau, 120 mm 154 $37,50 $5.775,00
PLA-RE00-030 10.810.11 FEILCHENFELD splinter forceps 115 mm 100 $87,30 $8.730,00
PLA-RE00-031 02-04-335 micro forceps straight 120 mm 112 $62,40 $6.988,80
PLA-RE00-032 02-04-331 micro forceps, str., 110 mm, 0,15 mm 105 $74,90 $7.864,50
PLA-RE00-033 02-04-511 ADSON forceps 1x2 teeth, 120 mm 165 $87,30 $14.404,50
PLA-RE00-035 02-04-700 ADSON BROWN forceps 7x7 t., 120 mm 123 $69,90 $8.597,70
PLA-RE00-037 02-04-236 MCcINDOE forceps serrated, 150 mm 117 $74,90 $8.763,30
PLA-RE00-038 06-15-450 LEMPERT rongeur, 185 mm, straight 76 $144,70 $10.997,20
PLA-RE00-039 46.165.13 TILLEY Nasal dress. forc., 2,2mm, 132 mm 91 548,60 $4.422,60
PLA-RE00-040 02-06-431 BACKHAUS towel forceps, 90 mm 161 $27,50 $4.427,50
PLA-RE00-041 02-08-140 HALSTED forceps, 140 mm, straight 61 $20,30 $1.238,30
PLA-RE00-043 64.110.13 ALLIS forceps 150 mm, 2x3 teeth 123 $44,90 $5.522,70
PLA-RE00-045 02-04-025 forceps narrow dress., 130 mm 98 $87,30 $8.555,40
PLA-RE00-046 06-02-400 Iforceps DEBAKEY,str.,160mm, 2,0 mm 121 $47,40 $5.735,40
PLA-RE00-047 10.130.13 |forceps narrow tissue 1x2 teeth, 130 mm 138 $44,90 $6.196,20
PLA-RE00-048 02-04-557 forceps tissue 1x2 t. 145 mm 165 $44,90 $7.408,50
PLA-RE00-049 02-08-108 HALSTED micro mosquito fcps.,str.,125mm 153 $44,90 $6.869,70
PLA-RE00-050 05-01-040 DUVAL grasp. forceps 13mm/180 mm 107 $57,50 $6.152,50
APLA-REOD-051 _ |24.170.15 _|CRILE MURRAY needleholder 150 mm 249 $94,80]  $23.605,20
APLA-R 2\, [02-13-035  |DE BAKEY needleholder 180 mm, TC 106 $66,30 $7.027,80
“IPLA-RE00-053( \|24.200.16 KILNER Needle holder 165 mm 119 $67,40 $8.020,60
PLA-REDG:054\ 7, }24.200.13 KILNER needleholder 135 mm ~p $66,10 $7.667,60
“|PtA-REQQ-055 | [02-13-204 | DERF needleholder 125 mm Wt g 724]  $6.516,00
Nua i
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PLA-RE00-056 02-63-064 |MAYO HEGAR needleholder 140 mm, TC 89| $117,20 $10.430,80
PLA-REQ0-057 02-13-054  |RYDER Vascular needle hold. 130 mm, TC slender pattern, micro profile 78| $119,70 $9.336,60
PLA-RE00-058 02-13-055 RYDER Vascular needle hold. 150 mm, TC slender pattern, micro profile 60! $122,20 $7.332,00
PLA-RE00-061 24.146.13 NEIVERT needleholder 130 mm 64 $47,40 $3.033,60
PLA-RE00-063 24.661.13 BARRAQUER needleh.w'out catch, 130 mm 56 $171,70 $9.615,20
PLA-RE00-064 02-63-202 WEBSTER needle holder smooth, 115 mm 85 $77,30 $6.570,50!
PLA-RE00-069  [04-06-114 [Mallets lead filled, 155g, 22mm, 19cm 107 $95,60]  $10.229,20
PLA-RE00-076 02-03-600 METZENBAUM fino scissors 145 mm, str. 96 $37,50 $3.600,00
PLA-RE00-078 02-03-258 METZENBAUM fino sciss.145mm TC, straight 142 $94,80 $13.461,60
PLA-RE00-079 06-04-118 Micro-Scissors YASARGIL,str.,145 mm,bay. 123 $247,20 $30.405,60
PLA-RE00-080 06-04-073 micro dissecting scissors, str., 165 mm 119 $247,20 $29.416,80!
PLA-RE00-081 09.140.08 VANNAS iridectomy scissors 80 mm 106 $144,70 $15.338,20
PLA-RE00-082 08.425.17 DEAN tonsil scissors 170 mm 87 $139,70! $12.153,90
PLA-RE00-083 02-03-100 Iris scissors, delicate, 90 mm, straight 164 $94,80 $15.547,20
PLA-RE00-084 02-53-178 REYNOLDS scissors straight, 145 mm 133 $112,30 $14.935,90
PLA-RE00-085 02-03-166 KILNER scissors 125 mm 118 $94,80! $11.186,40
PLA-RE00-086 08.901.14 LISTER bandage scissors 140 mm 154 $30,00 $4.620,00
PLA-RE00-087 02-03-324 STANDARD scissors, bl/sh. str. 145 mm 213 $30,00 $6.390,00
PLA-RE00-088 09.141.08 VANNAS iridectomy scissors 80 mm 153 $144,70 $22.139,10
PLA-RE00-089 09.143.08 VANNAS iridectomy scissors 80 mm 126 $144,70 $18.232,20
PLA-RE00-090 09.102.11 WESTCOTT tendon sciss. sh/sh., cvd.,11cm 99 $114,80 $11.365,20
PLA-RE00-091 09.104.11 WESTCOTT tendon sciss. bl/bl., cvd.,11cm 103 $114,80 $11.824,40
PLA-RE00-092 06-04-012 Micro-Scissors, straight, 120 mm flat handle 74 $148,30 $10.974,20
PLA-RE00-093 08.370.11 strablsmus scissors 115 mm, straight 126 $89,80 $11.314,80
PLA-RE00-095 15-11-350 HEYMANN-KNIGHT nasal scissors 175 mm 85 $53,20! $4.522,00
PLA-RE00-096 02-53-032 Iris scissors curved sideward 115 mm 96 $32,50 $3.120,00
PLA-RE00-098 02-03-157 JOSEPH scissors, 140 mm, curved 80 $35,00 $2.800,00
““[PLA-RE00-099 02-03-110 Iris Scissors, 110 mm, straight 81 $112,30! 59.096,30
REQ0-100 02-03-544 MAYO scissors straight, 140 mm 90 $87,30 57.857,00!
|PLA-REOD-102  02-03-672 MCINDOE cartilage scissors, 190 mm ~r 89 $137,20 $12.210,80!
i LA-RE00-104 02-03-166 KILNER scissors 125 mm N $87,30 $8.031,60
PLA-RE0D-105 02-03-168 KILNER scissors 150 mm iz . - v 589,80 $8.441,20
" PLA-REOG-106 _ |08.366.10 _|STEVENS tenotomy sciss. bl/bl, 105 mm< ™ -~ B [y $104,80]  $16.663,20
v » b i n
- - 0] 10480 1676800
PLAREOO-L07  [08.364.10 _ STEVENS tenotomy i, shsh, 100 mm straight y $36§0 B9
' ' "

PAREOC-L08  [08.584.15  JAMESON Dissecting scissor 150 mm, cvd. TR WGIER

DAREO0-L10 020306 [is scissors,fine, 115 mm, stralght T w0 S10900

DAREOCI03 (0203602 [METZENBAUM sisors st 180mm ]

TOTALUSD for above single tems
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SUP 91 PLA -2024-74

i

No |National code ITEM DESCRIPTION uomMm Qry. it total

1 | PLA-RE00-011 |Clamp microsurgery double venous 25mm 75gm PCS 79 54.2 4281.8

2 | PLA-RE00-012 |Clamp microsurgery double with suture Arterial 14mm 35mg PCS 83 54.2 4498.6

3 | PLA-RE00-013 |Clamp microsurgery double Arterial 17mm 45mg PCS 88 54.2 4769.6

4 | PLA-RE00-014 |Clamp microsurgery double Arterial 25mm 75mg PCS 70 54.2 3794

S | PLA-RE00-015 |Clamp microsurgery Approximator sizes 14 mm venous 17mm 25gm 35mm rte 45gm 75gm PCS 72 54.2 3902.4

6 | PLA-RE00-016 |Braith waite or watson skin graft knife PCS 250 33.21 8302.5

7 | PLA-Re00-017 EF'-E"“°"5 & RASDATORKES PCS 156 331 5163.6

8 | PLA-RE00-018 |Howarth nasal raspatory double ended PCS 85 35.66 3031.1

HOOKS & RETRACTORS:-

9 | PLA-RE00-021 Connball & haok PCS 190 31.22 5931.8
10| PLA-RE00-022 |Kilner skin hook PCS 163 32.92 5365.96
11| PLA-RED0-027 |Micro suturing tieing forceps 12cm curved PCS 141 52.45 7395.45
12| PLA-RE00-028 |Micro Adson forceps 12cm PCS 154 31.23 4809.42
13| PLA-RE00-030 |Micro groove dissecting forceps PCS 100 88.331 8833.1
14| PLA-RE00-031 |Micro- Jeweller forceps straight 12.5cm PCS 112 55.21 6183.52
15| PLA-RE00-032 |Micro- Jeweller forceps 11cm PCS 105 72.45 7607.25
16| PLA-RE00-033 |Adson dissecting ultra light Wt, toothed PCS 165 87.2 14388
17 | PLA-RE00-035 |Brown-Adson , multiple teeth PCS 123 65.33 8035.59
18| PLA-RE00-037 |Harrison dissecting forceps fine serrated jaws PCS 117 75.5 8833.5
19| PLA-RE00-038 |Lembert bone rongeur PCS 76 138.33 10513.08
20| PLA-RE00-039 |Tilly nasal dressing forceps (see ent) PCS 91 42.45 3862.95
21| PLA-RE00-040 |Backhaus pediatric towel forceps 7.5cm PCS 161 273 4395.3
22| PLA-RE00-041 [Kilner artery forceps PCS 61 19.44 1185.84
23| PLA-RE00-042 |Millard dissecting forceps skin hook (combined) PCS 113 64.9 7333.7
24| PLA-RE00-043 |Allis tissue forceps 15cm (2x3teeth) PCS 123 40.33 4960.59
25| PLA-RE00-045 |Delicate dissecting forceps PCS 98 92.65 9079.7
26| PLA-RE00-046 |Non traumatic dissecting forceps PCS 121 42.91 5192.11
27 | PLA-RE00-047 |Delicate tissue forceps PCS 138 41.09 5670.42
28| PLA-RE00-048 |Tissue forceps PCS 165 41.09 6779.85
29| PLA-RE00-049 |Delicate Haemostatic forceps PCS 153 41.09 6286.77
30| PLA-RE00-050 |intestional and tissue Grasping forceps PCS 107 51.09 5466.63
31| pLa-Reco-0s1 ::f::fu:‘:::i: SEk PCS 249 9155 22795.95
32| PLA-RE00-052 |De bakey 18cm microvascular needle holder PCS 106 62.9 6667.4
33| PLA-RE00-053 |Needle holder Kilner PCS 119 62.9 7485.1
34| PLA-RE00-054 |Needle holder Micro-Kilner 13cm PCS 116 62.9 7296.4
35| PLA-RE00-055 |Needle holder Derft micron PCS 90 62.9 5661
36| PLA-RE00-056 |Needle holder micro tungsten carbide jaw PCS 89 90.1 8018.9
37| PLA-RE00-057 |Needle holder ryder(micro )T.C. jaw 12.5 PCS 78 90.1 7027.8
38| PLA-RE00-058 |Needle holder ryder(micro)T.C.jaw 15m PCS 60 90.1 5406
39| PLA-RE00-059 |Needle holder-scissors olson hegar T.C.jaw PCS 96 40.54 3891.84
40| PLA-RE00-060 |Crile-wood needle holder 6 PCS 76 5 380
41| PLA-RE00-061 |Neivert needle holder 5" PCS 64 41 2624
42| PLA-RE00-062 |Olisen-Hegar needle holder & scissor _ PCS— \ 67 35.05 2348.35
43| PLA-RE00-063 |Troutman micro needle holder angle on flat without catch —T RS\ 56 143.63 8043.28
44| PLA-RE00-064 |Webster needle holder 4" . S\ T PCS - ) 85 73.8 6273
45| PLA-RE00-065 |Ryder needle hoider 4" R T e g 7342 PES 60 38.87 2332.2
46| PLA-RE00-066 |Ryder needle holder serrated 6" y S - 1\ ASFTY  pCs [ 3 73 52.45 3828.85
47| PLA-RE00-067 |Needle holder fine tipe Ve aye? PCS &\a- 91 14.5 1319.5
48| PLA-RE00-068 |Sommerland surgical marking pen e 1 ! 1901 6.5 12356.5
49| PLA-RE00-069 |Hammer for hand surgcry 19.5 cm \ st PCS 107 86.56 9261.92
50| PLA-REC0-070 Jurethral dilators s PCS 171 31.09 5316.39
51| PLA-RE00-073 |Self clearing suction tube ik PCS 181 27.8 5031.8
52| PLA-RE00-076 7 PCS 96 36.89 3541.44
53| PLA-RE00-077 -$ tucarbide blade scissor PCS 94 717 6739.8
54| PLA-RE00-078 |Metzenbaum fino tungestin carbide blade scissor PCS 142 80.5 11431
55| PLA-RE00-079 |Micro straight blades,bayonet shaped shamls scissor PCS 123 210 25830
56 | PLA-RE00-080 |Micro-Straight blades bevelled at tips bayonet scissor PCS 119 210 24990
57| PLA-RE00-081 |Micro vannas straight 8cm scissor PCS 106 132.5 14045
58] PLA-RE00-082 |Deam tonsil & cleft palate scissors PCS 87 132.5 11527.5
59| PLA-RE00-083 |Fine- Pointed scissors PCS 164 92.65 15194.6
60| PLA-RE00-084 |Pickett fine dissecting 5 % inch scissor PCS 133 95.34 12680.22
61| PLA-RE00-085 |Mancusi-ungaro tissue scissors 5 inch — PCS 118 92.85 10956.3
62| PLA-RE00-086 |Listers bandage scissors PCS 154 28.9 4450.6
63 | PLA-RE00-087 |Dressing scissors / \ PCS 213 28.9 6155.7
64| PLA-RE00-088 |Micro vannas curved plate scissor V4 / PCS 153 —|-—139.98 | 21416.94
65| PLA-RE00-089 |Micro vannas angled scissor / / PCS 126 139.98 17637.48
66| PLA-RE00-090 |Micro scissor 10.5cm straight i [ 99 109 ) 10791
67| PLA-RE00-091 103 " 11227

Micro :dtorfurved ()’
- i
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/ 68| PLA-RE00-092 |Micro-vascular adventitia 11cm straight scissor

PCS 74 139.98 10358.52
69| PLA-RE00-093 IStni‘Mﬂm blunt scissor PCS 126 91.55 11535.3
70| PLA-RE00-095 JAngled on flat scissor PCS 85 45 3825
71| PLA-RE00-096 JAlar cartilage scissors curved on flat 11.5cm PCS 96 29.6 2841.6
72| PLA-RE00-098 |Aufricht dissecting curved on flat scissor PCS 80 32.67 2613.6
73| PLA-RE00-099 |Aufricht dissecting fine scissor PCS 81 106.55 8630.55
74| PLA-RE00-100 |Rounded blades scissor PCS 90 87.7 7893
75| PLA-RE00-101 |Campbell rhinoplasty 11.5 scissor PCS 105 110.5 11602.5
76| PLA-RE00-102 |Cartilage fine serrated 18cm scissor PCS 89 1105 9834.5
77| PLA-RE00-104 |Kilner curved on flat scissor PCS 92 86 7912
78] PLA-RE00-105 |Kilner angled scissor PCS 94 86 8084
79| PLA-RE00-106 |Stevens tenotomy scissor 10cm blunt PCS 159 102.4 16281.6
80| PLA-REC0-107 |Stevens tenotomy pointed 10cm scissor PCS 160 102.4 16384
81| PLA-REC0-108 |Barsky nasal scissor PCS 84 35 2940
82| PLA-RE0D-110 |Delicate scissor PCS 145 110.4 16008
83| PLA-RE00-119 [Bone hand surgery sets Set 82 1560 127920
84| PLA-RE00-120 |Distraction apparatus for hand surgery (Kessler, 10cm , 6 cm) Set 125 1241 155125
85| PLA-RE00-121 |Mini external fixator for hand surgery set 66 994 65604
Cleft palate surgery sets various instraument L 3 gal) o Sl 130 g g O
B p scalpel handle no 3 marked in cms s/s 1 pes
Iris scissor STR 4.5" SH SH 1 PCS
1 PCS Gillies D.FCP6" 1 x2 TH - SERR
|Mcindoe D.FCP 6 " SERR 1 PCS
Kilner ret D/E "CASTPAW " sharp 6% " 1 PCS
Gillies skin hook standard 6.5 " 2PCS 7\
Mcindoe skin hook 2 prong 9mm x 6.5" (16.5 )em 2PCS i
Kilner needle holder 5.25 "(13.5 ) cm box joint 1PCS \
Derf needle holder 4.75 " (12 cm) box joint tunjesten carbide 1 PCS
86| PLA-RE00-122 |\ azzier suction tube 10 FG 1 PCS Set 54 3260 176040
Hoarth elevator double ended smooth + rugine end 9"(23 ¢cm ) 1PCS
Cleft palate respiratory left 5-1/2 " 1PCS
Cleft palate respiratory right 5-172 " 1PCS /\
Mcindose cleft palate respiratory D/E 6-1/2 1PCS
Dingman mouth gag frame 1PCS il
Dingman tounge plate only small 1 PCS
Dingman tounge plate only medium 1PCS
Dingman tounge plate only largel 1PCS
Mitchell trimmer 6.25 " (16cm ) doubleended 1PCS
Dental cartridge (A) syringe self aspirating 2.2 ml 1PCS / ‘V
Basic plastic surgery sets various instruments. A A e Cud) g 58 O (S i \j
Timesco chuck handle 5 (13 ) cm 1PCS ) \/C\j- -
Scalpel handle NO3 Marked in Cm S/S 2 PCS Scalpel handle Nod S/ S e 19y, -\\} N
1PCS .4\’ o e y
Scalpel handle No7 S/ S 1 PCS ij
Dressing scissor STR 5" (13 cm ) BL/BL 1 PCS
Myo scissors dished CVD 5.5 "(14 em) BL/BL 1 PCS e s
Strabismus scissors STR 4.5 " (11.5 ) BL/BL 1 PCS e -
Strabismus scissors CVD 4.5 " (11.5) BL/BL 1PCS S, “,
Iris Scissors straight 4.5 " (11.5) SH /SH 1PCS N /
scissors curved 7" (18 CM) BL/BL T.C 1 PCS
Steven tentomy scissor STR 4.5" (11.5) T.C 1PCS [
Adeson Dissecting FCP 5" (13cm ) SERR 1 PCS
(Adeson Dissecting FCP 5 " ( 13cm ) 1x 2th 1PCS
|Adeson Dissecting FCP 4.57 " (12 cm ) 1x2 th L/iwt 1 PCS
Adeson Dissecting FCP 4.57 " (12¢m ) 9x9 TH 1 PCS
87 | PLA-RE00-123|Gillies dissecting FCP 6" (15.5 cm ) 1x2 TH- SERR 1 PCS Set 91 2280.5 207525.5
Mcindoe dissecting FCP 6 " (15.5cm ) SERR 1PCS
Halstead mosquito AFCP CVD 5" (13 cm ) STD BJ SPCS
Kilner RET.D/E “ castpaw”SH 6.25 " ( 16 cm) 2PCS i
Langenbeck RET. (0.5"X1.75" cm (4.5 cm ))X 8.5"(21.5 cm) 2 PCS Langenbeck RET. / =
(1"(2.5 cm ) x 2.5" (6.5 cm ))X 8.5"(21.5 cm)2 PCS
West . Ret self retaining 3x4 prong SH 5.5 (14cm ) 1 PCS
Gillies skin hook STD 6.5 " (16 .5cm ) 2PCS L
Mcindoe skin hook 2 prong 9mm x 6.5 " (16.5c¢m ) 2PCS
Rampley sponge holding FCP 7" (18cm ) B.J 3PCS Al
Bachause towel FCP 3.75 " (9.5 cm) ATrauma B.J 2PCS )/ [
Allis Tissue FCP 6" (15.5cm ) 2x 3 TH BJ 2PCS g /
Lane Tissue FCP 6" (15.5cm ) 1x2 th B.J 2PCS 4 4
Nievert needle holder 5" (13 em ) B.J T.C 1PCS W
'Webster needle holder 5.5 (14 cm ) B.J T.C 1 PCS 3
Mitchell trimmer 6.25 " (16 cm ) D/E 1 PCS
'Volkmann bone curette medium B D/E 8.75 " (22cm ) 1 PCS
Dental cartridge (A) syringe self aspirating 2.3 ml 1 PCS
88| PLA-RE00-124 [Rhinoiplasty sets various Set 53 5250 278250

) S




89| PLA-RE00-126 Illpo suction set cannula Set 51 1204 6140.4
PLA-RE00-127 |Miniplati for hand set with diff. Plates screws 82
90 iniplating system surgery set - 38950
Basic set for microsurgery instrumentaJwi Sl Je ol i g Ol e a-dumont forceps
no.5 straight b-dumont forceps no.3 straight 13.5cm  c-curved microsurgical forceps
noJcurved12em  d-vessel dilating forceps no.D-5a 11 cm [
anblneedehold«mundhandledﬁanwlﬂmutlodmlzmw
f-surgical needle holder round handled 18 cm with out lock curved
jaw g-needle holding forceps no.5 ,angled
PLA-RED 45,11 cm h-adventitia scissor ,straight , 15 cm long blade i-miniature spring
i - scissor : vannas type with short curved blades J-vessel clamp : Set L e e
1-single acland clamp (A) , 3 Pieces (A1,A2,A3) 2-single acland clamp (V) , 3 Pieces
(V1,v2,v3) 3-double approximator clamp without suture holding frame
ALA2A3  VIV2)V3 k-mayer clamp
applyln;fomps,mnlsanulm«nlodl
92| PLA-RE00-129 |Skin grafting mesher with carrier ratio (2-2,31,41,6-1) B75 Set 97 3150 305550
93| PLA-RE00-134 |Tendon surgery set Set 80 880 70400
94| PLA-RE00-103 |Metzenbaum scissor PCS 115 94 10810
Two million two hundred twenty three thousand four hundred forty three Dollars and ninety six cents 2223443.96




